
Anti-Ragging Committee

WHAT CONSTITUTES RAGGING

In exercise of the jurisdiction conferred by Article 32 and Article 142 of the Constitution of India,
Ragging constitutes one or more of any of the following acts:

1. Any conduct by any student or students whether by words spoken or written or by an act which has
the effect of teasing, treating or handling with rudeness a fresher or any other student.

2. Indulging in rowdy or undisciplined activities by any student or students which causes or is likely to
cause annoyance, hardship, physical or psychological harm or to raise fear or apprehension thereof in
any fresher or any other student.

3. Asking any student to do any act which such student will not in the ordinary course do and which has
the effect of causing or generating a sense of shame, or torment or embarrassment so as to adversely
affect the physique or psyche of such fresher or any other student.

4. Any act by a senior student that prevents, disrupts or disturbs the regular academic activity of any
other student or a fresher.

5. Exploiting the services of a fresher or any other student for completing the academic tasks assigned to
an individual or a group of students.

6. Any act of financial extortion or forceful expenditure burden put on a fresher or any other student by
students.

7. Any act of physical abuse including all variants of it: sexual abuse, homo sexual assaults, stripping,
forcing obscene and lewd acts, gestures, causing bodily harm or any other danger to health or person.

8. Any act or abuse by spoken words, emails, post, public insults which would also include deriving
perverted pleasure, vicarious or sadistic thrill from actively or passively participating in the discomfiture
to fresher or any other student.

9. Any act that affects the mental health and self-confidence of a fresher or any other student with or
without an intent to derive a sadistic pleasure or showing off power, authority or superiority by a student
over any fresher or any other student.



PUNISHMENT AGAINST RAGGING

As per notification dated 25.03.2009 of All India Council for Technical Education (Prevention and
Prohibition of Ragging in Technical Institutions, Universities including deemed to be Universities
imparting Technical Education) Regulations, 2009, the punishment for those found guilty of ragging at
the Institution level shall be any one or any combination of the following:

1. Cancellation of admission

2. Suspension from attending classes and academic privileges

3. Withholding/ withdrawing scholarship/ free-studentship and other benefits

4. Debarring from appearing in any test/ examination or other evaluation process

5. Withholding results

6. Debarring from representing the Institution in any regional, national or international meet,
tournament, youth festival, etc.

7. Suspension/ expulsion from the hostel

8. Rustication from the Institution for period ranging from one to four semesters

9. Expulsion from the Institution and consequently debarring from admission to any other Institution

10. Fine of Rs.25000/-

11. Collective punishment when the person committing or abetting the crime of ragging is not identified.
The institute should going to resort to collective punishment as deterrent to ensure community pressure
on the potential ragger



RefNo Date: 16/08/2018

ANTI-RAGGING COMMITTEE

As per the directions of the Supreme Court Ruling and AICTE Notification F.No. 37-
3/Legal/AICTE/2009 Dated: 01/07/2009 , the Institute has formed the following Anti-ragging committee
for overseeing the implementation of the provisions of the verdict with immediate effect.

Ragging constitutes one or more of any intention by any student or group of students on:

1. Any act of Indiscipline, Teasing or Handling with Rudeness.

2. Any act that Prevents, Disrupts the Regular Academic Activity.

3. Any Act of Financial Extortion or Forceful Expenditure.

4. Any Act of Physical Abuse causing Assault, Harm or danger to Health.

5. Any Act of abuse by spoken words, emails, SMS or public insult etc.

6. Any Act of injury or infringement of the fundamental right to the human dignity.

7. Any Act of Wrongful Confinement, Kidnapping, molesting or committing unnatural offences, use

of criminal forces, trespass or intimidation.

8. Any unlawful assembly or conspiracy to ragging.

Punishment to those found guilty:

Any student or group of students found guilty of ragging in the campus or even outside the campus shall
be liable to one or more of the following punishments

1. Debarring from appearing in any Sessional test/University Examination

2. Suspension from attending classes and academic privileges

3. Withdrawing scholarships and other benefits

4. Suspension from the college for a period of one month

5. A FIR can be lodged without exception by the college authorities with the local police.



Objectives of Anti Ragging Committee:

1. Anti-Ragging Committee will be the Supervisory and Advisory Committee on matters of Planning
Action for Building and Preserving a Culture of Ragging Free Environment in the University Campus.

2. Anti Ragging Committee will be involved in designing strategies and action plan for curbing the
Menace of Ragging in the institute by adopting array of activities.

3. To prohibit any conduct of any student whether by words spoken or written or by an act which has the
effect of teasing, treating or handling with rudeness a fresher or any other student or students which
causes or is likely to cause annoyance, hardship or psychological harm to raise fear or apprehension to
any fresher or any student. 4. To take strict disciplinary action ranging from temporary suspension to
rustication from college against student/students who is/are found guilty of ragging.

5. To spread the awareness of "prohibiting, preventing and eliminating" the menace of ragging.

Role /Responsibilities of Anti Ragging Committee:

1. This Committee shall be fully responsible to ensure that no incidence of ragging takes place and will
also monitor and ensure that the instructions of these regulations are followed fully at all points of time.

2. If any type of ragging is occurred, immediately conduct the meeting and recommend appropriate
action appropriate action to be taken as per the Act of prohibition of ragging in Educational Institutions
to the concerned authorities.

3. Conduct Committee meeting frequently and discuss day to day situations in the campus and inform to
the higher authorities."

4. The Committee will also maintain alert vigil at all times and ensure that the Anti-Ragging Squads of
the institute carry out their functions properly and efficiently.



Objectives of Anti-Ragging Squad:

1. To advise the girl students to be in continuous communication with the parents, principal and the
faculty members with regard to any sort of ragging.

2. To monitor and oversee the performance of anti ragging squad in prevention of ragging in the
institution.

3. To make surprise raids in girls and boys common rooms and other places vulnerable to incidents of
and having the potential of ragging.

4. To conduct on the spot enquiry in to any incident of ragging.

Roles /Responsibilities of the Anti Ragging Squad:

1. Anti Ragging Squad will be working under the Monitoring of Anti Ragging Committee and will seek
advice from the Anti Ragging Committee.

2. The Functions of Anti Ragging Squad will be to keep a vigil and stop the incidences of Ragging, if
any, happening /reported in the places of Student aggregation including, Classrooms, Canteens, Buses,
Grounds, Hostels etc.

3. On the report any person who is the witness of the incidence of ragging or on the complaint of any
fresher student, immediate action will be taken by the Anti-Ragging Committee to decide appropriate
punishment.

4. Organize meeting with students especially with girls to advise them to regulate their own movements
and interactions, especially with strangers or undesirable characters.

5. The Squad will also educate the students at large by adopting various means about the Menace of
Ragging and related Punishments. Keep close watch on the visitors of non- students/strangers in the
college campus.

6. A gamut of positive reinforcement activities will have to be adopted by Anti-Ragging Squad for
orienting students and molding their personality for a better cause.

7. Scheduled inspection will be done by Anti-Ragging Squad and details should be updated in the
register maintained with Mr. Prabhat Das, (Anti-Ragging Squad inspection details) by respective
faculties.


